SPECIAL TOWN MEETING
TOWN OF SCITUATE
NOVEMBER 24, 2008

TOWN OF SCITUATE
SPECIAL TOWN MEETING

MONDAY, THE TWENTY-FOURTH OF NOVEMBER, 2008
7:00 PM, HIGH SCHOOL GYMNASIUM

ARTICLE 1
TRANSFERS

To see if the Town will vote to amend Article 5 of the 2008 Annual Town Meeting by
deleting the figure $52,918,593 and substituting therefore the figure $52,376,593; and
further, by adding the following language ‘““and to transfer $219,249 from Overlay
Surplus and $322,751 from Stabilization Fund; or take any other action relative thereto.
Sponsored By: Board of Selectmen

VOTED to amend Article 5 of the 2008 Annual Town Meeting by deleting the figure
$52,918,593 and substituting therefore the figure $52,572,402; and further, by
adding the following language “and to transfer $219,249 from Overlay Surplus and
$126,942 from Stabilization Fund

TWO-THIRDS VOICE VOTE.

ARTICLE 2
SCHOOL VEHICLES

To see if the Town will vote to amend Article 4, Item 3 of the 2007 Annual Town
Meeting by deleting the words “one school bus” and substituting therefore the words
“school vehicles”; or take any other action relative thereto.

Sponsored By: School Committee
VOTED: INDEFINITELY POSTPONE

ARTICLE 3
WATERWAYS

To see if the Town will vote to amend Article 6 of the 2008 Annual Town Meeting by
deleting the figure “$1,013,542” and substituting therefore the figure “$866,679”; and
further by deleting the figure “$728,591” and substituting therefore the figure
“$629,043”; and further by adding the words “and $46,969 from Waterways Retained
Earnings” after the word “Receipts”; or take any other action relative thereto.
Sponsored By: Board of Selectmen



SPECIAL TOWN MEETING
TOWN OF SCITUATE
NOVEMBER 24, 2008

VOTED to amend Article 6 of the 2008 Annual Town Meeting by deleting the figure
“$1,013,542” and substituting therefore the figure “$866,679”; and further by
deleting the figure “$728,591” and substituting the figure “$629,043:; and further
by adding the words “and $46,969 from Waterways Retained Earnings” after the
word “Receipts”.

UNANIMOUS VOICE VOTE

ARTICLE 4
TAKE-IT-OR-LEAVE-IT AREA

We request that the Selectmen reinstate the Take-It-or-Leave-It area at the Transfer
Station to its original previous location. The contents will be made available to the town
residents on Friday, Saturday and Sunday. This facility, like the Recycling Building,
encourages re-use of disposable items which is good for the community and the economy
in general.

Sponsored By: 100 Registered Voters

Moderator Richard Bowen reused himself from presiding over this article and stepped
down. Deputy Moderator Norman Paley presided for the discussion.

The representative sponsor, Charles Moncy, withdrew the article and requested that a

vote be taken that the Meeting pass the subject article as a non-binding resolution. The

resolution passed.
MAJORITY VOICE VOTE

I hereby certify the foregoing to be a true copy attest.

Bernice R. Brown, Town Clerk



